
PM Girls Throwers SWEEP CEDAR CREST!  PM BOYS THROWERS WIN 15 : 
12 

This was a night of DOMINATION. 

The Girls Track and Field Team beat Cedar Crest 93 : 57.  The Girls Throwers scored 27 
of the 93 points!  THEY SWEPT ALL THREE EVENTS 

In the GIRLS JAVELIN, co-captain and senior CARENNA NEELY took FIRST with a 
throw of 95′10″  Sophomore JESS HUBER took SECOND with a new personal record of 
93′ 4″  Senior BECCA CONNER took THIRD with a new personal record of 92′ 4″ 

In the GIRLS SHOT, senior BECCA CONNER took FIRST with a new personal record 
and league-qualifying mark of 33′ 4.25″  Her sister, junior SARAH CONNER took 
SECOND with a throw of 32′ 9.25″  And sophomore LAURA WISSLER took THIRD 
with a throw of 31′ 2.5″  As of 4/5, all three of these athletes have qualified for leagues in 
the shot put. 

In the GIRLS DISCUS, co-captain and senior CARENNA NEELY took FIRST with a 
new personal record of 119′ 9″  Carenna broke her previous record of 114′ 3″ a total of 
three times – first in the trials with a throw of 116′ 8″  Then with two throws in the finals: 
117′ and 119′ 9.  Junior HELEN DOOLITTLE took SECOND in the discus with a throw 
of 104′ 3″ and junior SARAH CONNER took THIRD with a new personal record of 102′ 
7″ There were four other girls over 90′ including sophomores Kami Mylin and Megan 
Haines, sophomore Jess Huber (with a personal record of 91′ 11), senior Becca Conner 
(with a personal record of 91′ 9″). 

In the BOYS SHOT, junior ANDE OLSON took FIRST against two strong Cedar Crest 
throwers.  He threw 45′ 3.5″ to win. 

In the BOYS DISCUS, junior ANDE OLSON took FIRST with a throw of 121′ 11″  
Junior TEON LEE took SECOND with a throw of 120′ 5″ and senior JUSTIN 
DIFFENBAUGH took THIRD with a throw of 115′ 8″  THE BOYS SWEPT THE 
DISCUS.  Junior Quinn Nadu was in finals with a throw of 115′ 4.  In exhibition, 
sophomore Evan Bigler had a personal record of 110′ 8″ 

In the BOYS JAV, senior JUSTIN DIFFENBAUGH took THIRD with a throw of 153′ 8. 

 

 

 

 



From Bobtrump.com 

Girls now seated #3, 4, 5 on Shot Put Honor Roll 

   Bailey Groves WAR 38′ 2.50″  

   Kayla Soders HEMP 33′ 10.0″  

   Sarah Conner PM 33′ 6.0″  

   Becca Conner PM 33′ 4.25″  

Shot Put 

   Laura Wissler PM 33′ 3.75″  

Girls seated #1-3, 5 on Discus Honor Roll 

   Carenna Neely PM 119′ 9″  

   Kami Mylin PM 107′ 5″  

   Helen Doolittle PM 107′ 0″  

   Sarah Fairbanks ET 104′ 5″  

Discus 

   Sarah Conner PM 102′ 7″  

 


